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BACKGROUND 

Mast cells (or mastocytes) predominantly reside in the connective tissue in 
the vicinity of blood vessels that contains many histamine-rich granules and 
heparin, but they also localize to mucos membranes where their activity is 
dependent on T cells. Mast cells play important roles in the development of 
allergies and anaphylaxis, but they also have a protective function. They are 
involved in wound healing and defense against pathogens. Mast cells are 
coated with Immunoglobulin E, which can bind to an allergen, thereby acti-
vating the cell. When activated, a mast cell rapidly releases its characteristic 
granules and various hormonal mediators into the interstitium. Mast cells 
may also be involved in the pathology associated with certain autoimmune 
disorders such as rheumatoid arthritis, bullous pemphigoid, and multiple 
sclerosis. 
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SOURCE 

Mast cell (MCG35) is a mouse monoclonal antibody raised against spleen 
cells and bone marrow cells of human origin. 

STORAGE 

Store at 4° C, **DO NOT FREEZE**. Stable for one year from the date of 
shipment. Non-hazardous. No MSDS required. 

PRODUCT 

Each vial contains 200 µg IgG1 kappa light chain in 1.0 ml of PBS with < 0.1% 
sodium azide and 0.1% gelatin. 

Mast cell (MCG35) is available conjugated to agarose (sc-53365 AC),  
500 µg/0.25 ml agarose in 1 ml, for IP; to HRP (sc-53365 HRP), 200 µg/ml, 
for WB, IHC(P) and ELISA; to either phycoerythrin (sc-53365 PE), fluorescein  
(sc-53365 FITC), Alexa Fluor® 488 (sc-53365 AF488), Alexa Fluor® 546  
(sc-53365 AF546), Alexa Fluor® 594 (sc-53365 AF594) or Alexa Fluor® 647 
(sc-53365 AF647), 200 µg/ml, for WB (RGB), IF, IHC(P) and FCM; and to either 
Alexa Fluor® 680 (sc-53365 AF680) or Alexa Fluor® 790 (sc-53365 AF790), 
200 µg/ml, for Near-Infrared (NIR) WB, IF and FCM. 

Alexa Fluor® is a trademark of Molecular Probes, Inc., Oregon, USA 

APPLICATIONS 

Mast cell (MCG35) is recommended for detection of Mast cell of human 
origin by immunofluorescence (starting dilution 1:50, dilution range 1:50-
1:500). 

RECOMMENDED SUPPORT REAGENTS 

To ensure optimal results, the following support reagents are recommended: 
1) Immunofluorescence: use m-IgGκ BP-FITC: sc-516140 or m-IgGκ BP-PE:  
sc-516141 (dilution range: 1:50-1:200) with UltraCruz® Mounting Medium:  
sc-24941 or UltraCruz® Hard-set Mounting Medium: sc-359850.  

RESEARCH USE 

For research use only, not for use in diagnostic procedures. 

PROTOCOLS 

See our web site at www.scbt.com for detailed protocols and support 
products. 


