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BACKGROUND

c-Jun N-terminal kinases (JNKs) phosphorylate and augment transcriptional
activity of c-Jun. JNKs originate from three genes that yield 10 isoforms
through alternative mRNA splicing, including JNK1α1, JNK1β1, JNK2α1,
JNK2β1 and JNK3α1, which represent the p46 isoforms, and JNK1α2,
JNK1β2, JNK2α2, JNK2β2 and JNK3β2, which represent the p54 isoforms.
JNKs coordinate cell responses to stress and influence regulation of cell
growth and transformation. The human JNK1 (PRKM8, SAPK1, MAPK8) gene
maps to chromosome 10q11.22 and shares 83% amino acid identity with
JNK2. JNK1 is necessary for normal activation and differentiation of CD4
helper T (TH) cells into TH1 and TH2 effector cells. Capsaicin activates JNK1
and p38 in Ras-transformed human breast epithelial cells. Nitrogen oxides
(NOx) upregulate JNK1 in addition to c-Fos, c-Jun and other signaling kinases,
including MEKK1 and p38. JNK3 (MK10, MAPK10, PRKM10) is activated by
pro-inflammatory cytokines and environmental stresss by phosphorylating
transcription factors such as c-Jun and ATF-2. This is important for AP-1 tran-
scriptional activity regulation. JNK3 is crucial for neuronal apoptosis (stress-
induced).
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CHROMOSOMAL LOCATION

Genetic locus: Mapk10 (mouse) mapping to 5 E5.

RESEARCH USE

For research use only, not for use in diagnostic procedures.

PRODUCT

JNK3 (m): 293T Lysate represents a lysate of mouse JNK3 transfected 293T
cells and is provided as 100 µg protein in 200 µl SDS-PAGE buffer.

APPLICATIONS

JNK3 (m): 293T Lysate is suitable as a Western Blotting positive control for
mouse reactive JNK3 antibodies. Recommended use: 10-20 µl per lane.

Control 293T Lysate: sc-117752 is available as a Western Blotting negative
control lysate derived from non-transfected 293T cells.

STORAGE

Store at -20° C. Repeated freezing and thawing should be minimized. Sample
vial should be boiled once prior to use. Non-hazardous. No MSDS required.

PROTOCOLS

See our web site at www.scbt.com for detailed protocols and support
products.


